
Department Vendor  Invoice # Date Amount Proposed Funding Source

Building Comm of Mass 20‐39 6/1/2020 10,000.00$                   TBD

Town Clerk LHS Associates 63921 1/1/2020 2,250.00$                     TBD

Town Clerk LHS Associates 64517 2/14/2020 1,565.00$                     TBD

Town Clerk LHS Associates 65648 6/2/2020 9,588.40$                     TBD

Town Clerk LHS Associates 63452 10/21/2019 1,387.50$                     TBD

Fire Columbia Gas various various 78.24$                           TBD

Town Counsel KP Law, PC 123950 12/20/2019 1,638.00$                    

26,507.14$                  

TOWN OF STOUGHTON

UNPAID BILLS

ANNUAL TOWN MEETING

MAY, 2021













Customer: Stoughton Fire Dept
Account #: 198904001

Billing Period  Usage (therms) 
 Transportation 

Charges Payments  Payments  Balance Dates Payments Posted
Beginning 
Balance 6/7/17 -$               

6/12/2017 0 19.80$                  $0.00 $0.00 19.80$            
7/12/2017 0 19.80$                  $0.00 $0.00 39.60$            
8/10/2017 1 20.39$                  ($19.80) $0.00 40.19$            7/24/2017
9/12/2017 0 19.80$                  ($20.39) $0.00 39.60$            9/1/2017

10/11/2017 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 39.60$            10/5/2017
11/9/2017 0 19.80$                  $0.00 $0.00 59.40$            

12/11/2017 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) ($19.80) 39.60$            11/14/17 & 12/6/17
1/10/2018 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 39.60$            1/10/2018
2/9/2018 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 39.60$            2/5/2018

3/12/2018 63 58.44$                  $0.00 $0.00 98.04$            
4/10/2018 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) ($19.80) 78.24$            3/14/18 & 4/4/18
5/10/2018 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 78.24$            5/7/2018
6/12/2018 1 20.45$                  ($19.80) $0.00 78.89$            5/30/2018
7/11/2018 0 19.80$                  ($20.45) $0.00 78.24$            7/6/2018
8/18/2018 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 78.24$            8/2/2018
9/12/2018 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 78.24$            9/6/2018

10/10/2018 0 19.80$                  $0.00 $0.00 98.04$            
11/9/2018 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) ($19.80) 78.24$            11/1/2018

12/11/2018 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 78.24$            12/5/2018
1/10/2019 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 78.24$            1/10/2019
2/11/2019 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 78.24$            2/6/2019
3/12/2019 0 19.80$                  $0.00 $0.00 98.04$            
4/9/2019 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) ($19.80) 78.24$            4/1/19 & 4/4/19

5/10/2019 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 78.24$            5/9/2019
6/11/2019 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 78.24$            6/10/2019
7/11/2019 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 78.24$            7/5/2019
8/12/2019 0 19.80$                  ($19.80) $0.00 78.24$            8/7/2019



11/9/2020 Stoughton Mail - Fwd: Stoughton Fire Dept - Account 198904001

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=3bcfc28173&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1682903584810434891&simpl=msg-f%3A1682903584810434891 1/2

Mary Jane Martin <mjmartin@stoughton-ma.gov>

Fwd: Stoughton Fire Dept - Account 198904001
1 message

Kathy McGrady <sfdclerk@stoughton-ma.gov> Mon, Nov 9, 2020 at 12:11 PM
To: Mary Jane Martin <mjmartin@stoughton-ma.gov>

good afternoon, remember our discussion about non payment of gas balance.  here is the excel spreadsheet done by
gas company employee i spoke to for payment history and anything missing.  I may have attached to original request
but this has been sitting in my email and want to get rid of it...:)

ty
Kathy McGrady
Program Administrator I
Stoughton Fire Department
1550 Central Street
Stoughton, MA  02072
Phone: 781-344-3170 x 9750
Fax: 781-341-3927
kmcgrady@stoughton-ma.gov

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <NPorro@nisource.com>
Date: Wed, Aug 14, 2019 at 3:20 PM
Subject: Stoughton Fire Dept - Account 198904001
To: <kmcgrady@stoughton-ma.gov>

Hi Kathy,
I did a spreadsheet to see what is still noted as unpaid and it looks like
it's one of the $19.80  and the March 12, 2018 billing of $58.44.  Hope
this helps.

(See attached file: Stought Fire Dept 198904001.xls)

Norma Porro
Choice Account Specialist - Nipsco
55 Foundation Avenue, Suite 200
Haverhill, MA  01835
Phone:  978-556-8916
Fax:       978-556-8929

"Please make safety an important part of your every day life"

_________________________________________
ATTENTION:  This message and all attachments are PRIVATE, and may contain
information that is CONFIDENTIAL and PRIVILEGED.  If you received this
message in error, please notify sender by reply e-mail and delete the
message immediately.
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Stought Fire Dept 198904001.xls
26K
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